
Adrian is one of the firms co founder’s and has
arranged for the stepped equity investment into the
firms IP and the digital platforms for execution (of the
legal services new age model).

Adrian is also an adviser to the firm in its USA and BVI
operations and is based on the east coast of the US.
Adrian has over twenty-five years’ experience in
accounting and finance internationally.

Adrian commenced his career with the chartered
accounting firm, KPMG. Adrian then moved into the
banking and finance industry gaining significant
transactional experience working for National
Australia Bank (NAB) in credit, project finance and
structured finance both domestically and
internationally in New York. After leaving NAB, Adrian
joined the global credit rating agency Standard &
Poor’s (S&P;) in its global structured finance area also
based in New York. Adrian held the position of a lead
analyst at S&P; in both structured bonds and equities.
Adrian’s analytical research was widely published in
United States and he was also regularly interviewed by
the US financial media.

He recently worked in a senior funding position at
Queensland Treasury Corporation in Australia.

A member of the Chartered Accountants Australia
and New Zealand, a CPA in Virginia (US) and gained
an undergraduate degree in accounting from Charles
Sturt University and a Masters in Finance from the
University of Technology, Sydney.
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